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The black revolution is much more than a struggle for the rights of Negroes. It is 
forcing America to face all its interrelated flaws—racism, poverty, militarism, and 
materialism. It is exposing evils that are rooted deeply in the whole structure of our 
society ... and suggests that radical reconstruction of society is the real issue to be 
faced. 

—Martin Luther King Jr. 
 

 

 
Stories are wonderful things. And they are dangerous. 

Thomas King 
 
 
 

 

The civil rights movement circulates through American memory in forms and 

through channels that are at once powerful, dangerous, and hotly contested. Civil 

rights memorials jostle with the South's ubiquitous monuments to its Confederate 

past. Exemplary scholarship and documentaries abound, and participants have 
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produced wave after wave of autobiographical accounts, at least two hundred to date. 

Images of the movement appear and reappear each year on Martin Luther King Jr. 

Day and during Black History Month. Yet remembrance is always a form of 

forgetting, and the dominant narrative of the civil rights movement—distilled from 

history and memory, twisted by ideology and political contestation, and embedded in 

heritage tours, museums, public rituals, textbooks, and various artifacts of mass 

culture—distorts and suppresses as much as it reveals.11 

      Centering on what Bayard Rustin in 1965 called the "classical" phase of the 
struggle, the dominant narrative chronicles a short civil rights movement that begins 
with the 1954 Brown v. Board of Education decision, proceeds through public 
protests, and culminates with the passage of the Civil Rights Act of 1964 and the 
Voting Rights Act of 1965.2 Then comes the decline. After a season of moral clarity, 
the country is beset by the Vietnam War, urban riots, and reaction against the excesses 
of the late 1960s and the 1970s, understood variously as student rebellion, black 
militancy, feminism, busing, affirmative action, or an overweening welfare state. A 
so-called white backlash sets the stage for the conservative interregnum that, for good 
or ill, depending on one's ideological persuasion, marks the beginning of another 
story, the story that surrounds us now. 
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      Martin Luther King Jr. is this narrative's defining figure—frozen in 1963, 
proclaiming "I have a dream" during the march on the Mall. Endlessly reproduced and 
selectively quoted, his speeches retain their majesty yet lose their political bite. We 
hear little of the King who believed that "the racial issue that we confront in America 
is not a sectional but a national problem" and who attacked segregation in the urban 
North. Erased altogether is the King who opposed the Vietnam War and linked racism 
at home to militarism and imperialism abroad. Gone is King the democratic socialist 
who advocated unionization, planned the Poor People's Campaign, and was 
assassinated in 1968 while supporting a sanitation workers' strike.3 
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      By confining the civil rights struggle to the South, to bowdlerized heroes, to a 
single halcyon decade, and to limited, noneconomic objectives, the master narrative 
simultaneously elevates and diminishes the movement. It ensures the status of the 
classical phase as a triumphal moment in a larger American progress narrative, yet it 
undermines its gravitas. It prevents one of the most remarkable mass movements in 
American history from speaking effectively to the challenges of our time. 
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      While the narrative I have recounted has multiple sources, this essay emphasizes 
how the movement's meaning has been distorted and reified by a New Right bent on 
reversing its gains. I will then trace the contours of what I take to be a more robust, 
more progressive, and truer story—the story of a "long civil rights movement" that 
took root in the liberal and radical milieu of the late 1930s, was intimately tied to the 
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"rise and fall of the New Deal Order," accelerated during World War II, stretched far 
beyond the South, was continuously and ferociously contested, and in the 1960s and 
1970s inspired a "movement of movements" that "def[ies] any narrative of collapse."4 
      Integral to that more expansive story is the dialectic between the movement and 
the so-called backlash against it, a wall of resistance that did not appear suddenly in 
the much-maligned 1970s, but arose in tandem with the civil rights offensive in the 
aftermath of World War II and culminated under the aegis of the New Right. The 
economic dimensions of the movement lie at the core of my concerns, and throughout 
I will draw attention to the interweavings of gender, class, and race. In this essay, 
however, racial narratives and dilemmas will take center stage, for, as Lani Guinier 
and Gerald Torres suggest, "Those who are racially marginalized are like the miner's 
canary: their distress is the first sign of a danger that threatens us all."5 
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      A desire to understand and honor the movement lies at the heart of the rich and 
evolving literature on the 1950s and early 1960s, and that era's chroniclers have 
helped endow the struggle with an aura of cultural legitimacy that both reflects and 
reinforces its profound legal, political, and social effects. By placing the world-
shaking events of the classical phase in the context of a longer story, I want to buttress 
that representational project and reinforce the moral authority of those who fought for 
change in those years. At the same time, I want to make civil rights harder. Harder to 
celebrate as a natural progression of American values. Harder to cast as a satisfying 
morality tale. Most of all, harder to simplify, appropriate, and contain.6 
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The Political Uses of Racial Narratives   
The roots of the dominant narrative lie in the dance between the movement's 
strategists and the media's response. In one dramatic protest after another, civil rights 
activists couched their demands in the language of democratic rights and Christian 
universalism; demonstrated their own respectability and courage; and pitted coercive 
nonviolence against guns, nightsticks, and fists. Played out in the courts, in legislative 
chambers, in workplaces, and in the streets, those social dramas toppled the South's 
system of disfranchisement and de jure or legalized segregation by forcing the hand of 
federal officials and bringing local governments to their knees. The mass media, in 
turn, made the protests "one of the great news stories of the modern era," but they did 
so very selectively. Journalists' interest waxed and waned along with activists' ability 
to generate charismatic personalities (who were usually men) and telegenic 
confrontations, preferably those in which white villains rained down terror on 
nonviolent demonstrators dressed in their Sunday best. Brought into American living 
rooms by the seductive new medium of television and replayed ever since, such 
scenes seem to come out of nowhere, to have no precedents, no historical roots. To 
compound that distortion, the national press's overwhelmingly sympathetic, if 
misleading, coverage changed abruptly in the mid-1960s with the advent of black 
power and black uprisings in the urban North. Training a hostile eye on those 
developments, the cameras turned away from the South, ignoring the southern 
campaign's evolving goals, obscuring interregional connections and similarities, and 
creating a narrative breach between what people think of as "the movement" and the 
ongoing popular struggles of the late 1960s and the 1970s.7 
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      Early studies of the black freedom movement often hewed closely to the 
journalistic "rough draft of history," replicating its judgments and trajectory. More 
recent histories, memoirs, and documentaries have struggled to loosen its hold.8 Why, 
then, has the dominant narrative seemed only to consolidate its power? The answer 
lies, in part, in the rise of other storytellers—the architects of the New Right, an 
alliance of corporate power brokers, old-style conservative intellectuals, and 
"neoconservatives" (disillusioned liberals and socialists turned Cold War hawks). 
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      The Old Right, North and South, had been on the wrong side of the revolution, 
opposing the civil rights movement and reviling its leaders in the name of property 
rights, states' rights, anticommunism, and the God-given, biological inferiority of 
blacks. Largely moribund by the 1960s, the conservative movement reinvented itself 
in the 1970s, first by incorporating neoconservatives who eschewed old-fashioned 
racism and then by embracing an ideal of formal equality, focusing on blacks' 
ostensible failings, and positioning itself as the true inheritor of the civil rights 
legacy.9 Like all bids for discursive and political power, this one required the warrant 
of the past, and the dominant narrative of the civil rights movement was ready at 
hand. Reworking that narrative for their own purposes, these new "color-blind 
conservatives" ignored the complexity and dynamism of the movement, its growing 
focus on structural inequality, and its "radical reconstruction" goals. Instead, they 
insisted that color blindness—defined as the elimination of racial classifications and 
the establishment of formal equality before the law—was the movement's singular 
objective, the principle for which King and the Brown decision, in particular, stood. 
They admitted that racism, understood as individual bigotry, did exist—"in the distant 
past" and primarily in the South—a concession that surely would have taken the Old 
Right by surprise.10 But after legalized Jim Crow was dismantled, such irrationalities 
diminished to insignificance. In the absence of overtly discriminatory laws and with 
the waning of conscious bias, American institutions became basically fair. Free to 
compete in a market-driven society, African Americans thereafter bore the onus of 
their own failure or success. If stark group inequalities persisted, black attitudes, 
behavior, and family structures were to blame. The race-conscious remedies devised 
in the late 1960s and 1970s to implement the movement's victories, such as majority-
minority voting districts, minority business set-asides, affirmative action, and two-
way busing, were not the handiwork of the authentic civil rights movement at all. 
Foisted on an unwitting public by a "liberal elite" made up of judges, intellectuals, 
and government bureaucrats, those policies not only betrayed the movement's original 
goals; they also had little effect on the economic progress blacks enjoyed in the late 
1960s and 1970s, which was caused not by grass-roots activism or governmental 
intervention but by impersonal market forces. In fact, the remedies themselves 
became the cause of our problems, creating resentment among whites, subverting self-
reliance among blacks, and encouraging "balkanization" when nationalism and 
assimilation should be our goals.11 It was up to color-blind conservatives to restore the 
original purpose of civil rights laws, which was to prevent isolated acts of wrongdoing 
against individuals, rather than, as many civil rights activists and legal experts 
claimed, to redress present, institutionalized manifestations of historical injustices 
against blacks as a group.12 
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      Germinated in well-funded right-wing think tanks and broadcast to the general 11  



public, this racial narrative had wide appeal, in part because it conformed to white, 
middle-class interests and flattered national vanities and in part because it resonated 
with ideals of individual effort and merit that are widely shared. The American creed 
of free-market individualism, in combination with the ideological victories of the 
movement (which ensured that white supremacy must "hide its face"), made the 
rhetoric of color blindness central to the "war of ideas" initiated by the New Right in 
the 1970s. With Ronald Reagan's presidential victory in 1980, and even more so after 
the Republican sweep of Congress in 1994, that rhetoric entrenched itself in public 
policy. Dovetailing with the retreat from race-specific remedies among centrist 
liberals, it crossed traditional political boundaries, and it now shapes the thinking of 
"a great many people of good will."13 
      Clearly, the stories we tell about the civil rights movement matter; they shape how 
we see our own world. "Facts" must be interpreted, and those interpretations—
narrated by powerful storytellers, portrayed in public events, acted upon in laws and 
policies and court decisions, and grounded in institutions—become primary sources of 
human action. Those who aspire to affect public opinion and policy and thus to 
participate in "the endless struggle over our collective destiny" must always ask 
themselves not only "which stories to advance, contest, and accept as 'true'" but also 
how to discipline those stories with research and experience and to advance them with 
power. In the world of symbolic politics, the answers to those questions determine 
who will prevail.14 
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      In that spirit, I will turn now to a story of my own—the story of the long civil 
rights movement and of the resistance to it. Throughout, I will draw on the work of a 
wide range of historians, tying together stories usually told separately in order to alter 
common understandings of the black freedom struggle (and of how we arrived at the 
dilemmas of the new millennium) in at least six major ways. First, this new, longer 
and broader narrative undermines the trope of the South as the nation's "opposite 
other," an image that southernizes racism and shields from scrutiny both the economic 
dimensions of southern white supremacy and the institutionalized patterns of 
exploitation, segregation, and discrimination in other regions of the country—patterns 
that survived the civil rights movement and now define the South's racial landscape as 
well. Second, this narrative emphasizes the gordian knot that ties race to class and 
civil rights to workers' rights. Third, it suggests that women's activism and gender 
dynamics were central both to the freedom movement and to the backlash against it. 
Fourth, it makes visible modern civil rights struggles in the North, Midwest, and 
West, which entered a new phase with the turn to black nationalism in the mid-1960s 
but had begun at least a quarter century before. Fifth, it directs attention to the effort 
to "make use of the reforms won by the civil rights movement" in the 1970s, after the 
national movement's alleged demise.15 And finally, it construes the Reagan-Bush 
ascendancy not simply as a backlash against the "movement of movements" of the 
late 1960s and 1970s, but as a development with deep historical roots. 
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The Long Backlash   
Two great internal migrations gave rise both to the long civil rights movement and to 
the interests and ideologies that would ultimately feed the most telling resistance to it: 
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the exodus of African Americans to the cities of the South, North, and West 
precipitated by the collapse of the southern sharecropping system and the mass 
suburbanization of whites. Accelerating during World War II, those vast relocations 
of people and resources transformed the racial geography of the country. Each 
responded to and acted on the other. They were fatefully, although often invisibly, 
entwined.16 
      Gender, class, region, and race all shaped both migration experiences. Because 
discrimination in the North shunted black men into the meanest factory jobs, women 
carried the burden of a double day. Relegated mainly to domestic service, they 
combined wage earning not only with homemaking but with kin work and social 
networking, practices that were rooted in the folk and family traditions of the South, 
bound neighborhoods together, and provided the safety net that discriminatory welfare 
policies denied. Such networks also helped to blur urban-rural boundaries, ensuring 
that struggles in the city and the countryside would be mutually reinforcing.17 
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      As rural black folk grappled with the planter-dominated policies and practices that 
exploited their labor and drove them from the land, urban migrants fought to "keep 
Mississippi out of California" and the "plantation mentality" out of the cities of the 
South.18 Indeed, the resonance of the plantation metaphor for blacks throughout the 
country suggests the depth and durability of rural memories and interregional 
connections. In one sense, however, the metaphor is misleading. For black migrants 
who made their way to the "promised land" found themselves confronting not 
Mississippi in California but indigenous forms of discrimination and de facto 
segregation—the result not of custom, as "de facto" implies, but of a combination of 
individual choices and governmental policies (some blatant and some race neutral on 
their face) that had the effect, and often the intent, of barring African Americans from 
access to decent jobs, schools, and homes, as well as to the commercialized leisure 
spaces that increasingly symbolized "making it in America" for white ethnics en route 
to the middle class. 
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      Ironically, New Deal programs helped to erect those racial barriers. In tandem 
with the higher wages won by the newly empowered unions of the Congress of 
Industrial Organizations (CIO), the expansion of the welfare state mitigated the 
terrible insecurity of working-class life for blacks and whites alike. Yet the 
"gendered" and "raced" imagination of New Deal reformers also built racial and 
gender inequality into the very foundation of the modern state.19 Those inequalities 
were intensified by the concessions exacted both by conservative Republican 
congressmen and by southern Democrats, who owed their congressional seniority and 
thus their domination of key committees to the South's constricted electorate and one-
party rule. 

17  

      One manifestation of systemic inequality was a two-track welfare system rooted in 
a "family wage" ideal that figured the worker as a full-time breadwinner who 
supported children and a dependent, non-wage-earning wife at home—an ideal from 
which most people of color were excluded. When unemployment insurance was 
enacted in 1935, for example, it did not extend to agricultural and domestic workers, 
whom reformers did not see as independent, full-time breadwinners, and on whom the 
South's low-wage economy depended. As a result, 55 percent of all African American 
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workers and 87 percent of all wage-earning African American women were excluded 
from one of the chief benefits of the New Deal. In lieu of such protections, African 
Americans were dependent on—and stigmatized by—the stingy, means-tested 
programs known as "welfare" today.20 
      As metropolitan populations exploded, a mad scramble for housing brought 
African Americans face to face with another limitation of the New Deal: white men 
benefited disproportionately from the G.I. Bill of Rights, a mammoth social welfare 
program for returning veterans passed by Congress at the end of World War II. In 
combination with an equally ambitious housing program, the G.I. Bill drew aspiring 
ethnic workers and the white middle class out of the city, away from black neighbors, 
and into ever-expanding suburban rims. Centuries of racial denigration, compounded 
by divisions built into the two-track welfare system, predisposed white urbanites to 
fear black migrants. But what came to be known as "white flight" was caused not just 
by individual attitudes but also by a panoply of profit- and government-driven 
policies. Local zoning boards and highway building choices equated "black" with 
"blight," frightening away white buyers and steering investment away from black 
urban neighborhoods. Blockbusting real estate agents stampeded whites into selling 
cheap and blacks into buying dear. Redlining banks denied mortgages to African 
Americans and to buyers in "mixed" neighborhoods. Most important, the Federal 
Housing Administration pursued lending policies that not only favored but practically 
mandated racial homogeneity.21 
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      Encouraged by tax incentives, highway building programs, and a desire to 
outflank the new unions, factories and businesses moved to the suburbs as well, 
eroding the cities' tax base, damaging infrastructure, and eviscerating municipal 
services. The growth of segregated suburbs also exacerbated the trend toward almost 
complete segregation in urban schools. The practice of supporting public education 
through local taxes and the fiercely guarded divide between urban and suburban 
school districts, combined with conscious, racially motivated choices regarding the 
siting of schools and the assignment of pupils, relegated black migrants to schools that 
were often as separate and as unequal as those they had left behind.22 
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      This cascading process of migration, job discrimination, suburbanization, and 
race-coded New Deal reform had three major effects. First, over the course of the 
1940s race became increasingly spatialized, rendering invisible to whites the 
accumulated race and class privileges that undergirded what suburbanites came to see 
as the rightful fruits of their own labor. Second, the "suburban frontier" spawned a 
new homeowners' politics based on low taxes, property rights, neighborhood 
autonomy, and a shrinking sense of social responsibility, all of which became 
entangled with racial identity in ways that would prove extremely difficult to undo.23 
Finally, African Americans, already burdened by the social and economic 
deprivations of slavery and Jim Crow, found themselves disadvantaged by 
employment practices and state policies that amounted to affirmative action for 
whites. In a society where a home represented most families' single most important 
asset, for example, differential access to mortgages and housing markets and the racial 
valuation of neighborhoods translated into enormous inequalities. Passed on from 
generation to generation, those inequalities persist to this day. Short-circuiting the 
generational accumulation of wealth and social capital that propelled other ethnic 
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minorities into the expanding post–World War II middle class, those policies left a 
legacy of racial inequality that has yet to be seriously addressed.24 
    
Southern Strategies   
We now have a copious literature on postwar suburbanization and the deepening of 
segregation in the North and West. But too often, the already segregated, rural, 
backward South figures in this story only as a footnote or an exception to the rule. In 
fact, because southern cities grew up in the age of New Deal reform, the automobile, 
and suburban sprawl, the modern South might better be seen as a paradigm.25 
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      Looking back from the perspective of the dominant narrative, it is easy to see a 
peculiar system of legal segregation as the South's defining feature. But spatial 
separation was never the white South's major goal. Black and white southerners 
engaged in constant and nuanced interactions, moderated by personal ties, economic 
interests, and class and gender dynamics and marked by cultural exchange.26 Taking 
place as they did within a context of racial hierarchy, those interactions did not 
diminish segregation's perniciousness and power. Yet given the ubiquity of black-
white contact and the crucial role of blacks as a source of cheap labor, what we think 
of as the age of segregation might better be called the age of "racial capitalism," for 
segregation was only one instrument of white supremacy, and white supremacy 
entailed not only racial domination but also economic practices. Pursued by an 
industrial and agricultural oligarchy to aggrandize themselves and forward a particular 
development strategy for the region, those practices involved low taxes, minimal 
investment in human capital, the separation and political immobilization of the black 
and white southern poor, the exploitation of non-unionized, undereducated black and 
white labor, and the patriarchal control of families and local institutions.27 
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      That strategy created a particularly brutal and openly racialized social system, 
especially in the Deep South. But its basic doctrines—racial and class subordination, 
limited government regulation, a union-free workplace, and a racially divided 
working class—dovetailed seamlessly with an ethic of laissez-faire capitalism rooted 
deeply in American soil.28 This is not to minimize regional differences. It is, however, 
to suggest that the further we move away from the campaigns that overturned the 
South's distinctive system of state-sponsored segregation, the easier it is to see the 
broader and ultimately more durable patterns of privilege and exploitation that were 
American, not southern, in their origins and consequences. 
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      Those common patterns meant that the South's postwar prosperity could narrow 
regional differences without eliminating racial gaps. Change began in earnest in the 
1940s and accelerated in the 1950s and 1960s, as southern Democrats, responding 
selectively to the activist New Deal state (rather than opposing it, as observers often 
assume), used their congressional seniority to garner a disproportionate share of 
defense spending while demanding local and state control over federal programs for 
housing, hospital construction, education, and the like. That strategy helped raise 
wages and triple regional incomes in the 1940s, but it also blunted federal 
antidiscrimination efforts.29 At the same time, southern industrialists, like their 
counterparts in other regions, reacted to rising wages and to the labor militancy that 
followed World War II by installing laborsaving machinery and eliminating the jobs 
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held by blacks, while whites monopolized the new skilled and white-collar jobs, 
which demanded qualifications denied to blacks by both educational inequities and 
discriminatory practices that barred them from learning on the job. Thus even as the 
South prospered, racial disparities widened.30 
      Much of the South's new technical and managerial work force, moreover, was 
imported from the urban North. Before World War II, the chief goal of most southern 
politicians was to maintain the South's isolation and the captive labor supply on which 
the sharecropping system depended. Afterward, boosterism became these leaders' 
raison d'être and "the selling of the South" began. Low corporate taxes, low welfare 
benefits, and "look-the-other-way environmental policies," coupled with federally 
financed highway-building campaigns, attracted northern industry and an influx of 
northern-born, Republican-bred branch managers, supervisors, and technicians.31 
Those newcomers settled with their southern-born counterparts in class- and race-
marked enclaves created by the same ostensibly race-neutral public policies that 
spatialized race in the North. With mushrooming suburbanization came the attitudes 
and advantages that would undergird the South's version of homeowner politics—the 
politics of the long backlash everywhere. Richard M. Nixon's "southern strategy," 
which attacked welfare, busing, and affirmative action in order to bring white 
southerners into the Republican fold, targeted such voters: middle-class suburbanites, 
including skilled workers from outside the South and young families who had come of 
age after the Brown decision and were uncomfortable with the openly racist rhetoric 
of massive resistance. Aimed also at white workers in the urban North, that strategy 
helped make the South a chief stronghold of the Republican party as, over the next 
quarter century, the party cast off its moderates and set about dismantling the New 
Deal order.32 
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The Long Civil Rights Movement   
Yet the outcome was not inevitable. It would take many years of astute and aggressive 
organizing to bring today's conservative regime to power. It took such effort because 
another force also rose from the caldron of the Great Depression and crested in the 
1940s: a powerful social movement sparked by the alchemy of laborites, civil rights 
activists, progressive New Dealers, and black and white radicals, some of whom were 
associated with the Communist party. Robert Korstad calls it "civil rights unionism," 
Martha Biondi the "Black Popular Front"; both terms signal the movement's 
commitment to building coalitions, the expansiveness of its social democratic vision, 
and the importance of its black radical and laborite leadership. A national movement 
with a vital southern wing, civil rights unionism was not just a precursor of the 
modern civil rights movement. It was its decisive first phase.33 
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      The link between race and class lay at the heart of the movement's political 
imagination. Historians have depicted the postwar years as the moment when race 
eclipsed class as the defining issue of American liberalism.34 But among civil rights 
unionists, neither class nor race trumped the other, and both were expansively 
understood. Proceeding from the assumption that, from the founding of the Republic, 
racism has been bound up with economic exploitation, civil rights unionists sought to 
combine protection from discrimination with universalistic social welfare policies and 
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individual rights with labor rights. For them, workplace democracy, union wages, and 
fair and full employment went hand in hand with open, affordable housing, political 
enfranchisement, educational equity, and an enhanced safety net, including health care 
for all.35 
      The realization of this vision depended on the answers to two questions. First, 
could the black-labor-left coalition reform the social policies forged during the Great 
Depression, extending to blacks the social and economic citizenship the New Deal 
had provided to an expanding state-subsidized middle class and an upper echelon of 
male workers? Second, could the coalition take advantage of the New Deal and the 
surge of progressive thought and politics in the American South to break the grip of 
the southern oligarchy in the region?36 
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      Extending the New Deal and reforming the South were two sides of the same coin 
because seven out of ten African Americans still lived in the former Confederate 
states and because conservative southern Democrats possessed such disproportionate 
power in Congress.37 To challenge the southern Democrats' congressional 
stranglehold, the movement had to enfranchise black and white southern workers and 
bring them into the house of labor, thus creating a constituency on which the region's 
emerging pro–civil rights, prolabor politicians could rely. If the project failed and the 
conservative wing of the southern Democratic party triumphed, the South would 
become a magnet for runaway industries and a power base for a national conservative 
movement, undercutting the northern bastions of organized labor and unraveling the 
New Deal.38 
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      During the 1940s half a million unionized black workers, North and South, put 
themselves in the front ranks of the effort. The "Double V" campaign, for victory over 
fascism abroad and racism at home; the prolabor policies of the Roosevelt 
administration; the booming economy, which made labor scarce and triggered the 
biggest jump in black earnings since emancipation; the militancy of the black- and 
Left-led unions; the return of black veterans—all taken together "generated a rights 
consciousness that gave working-class black militancy a moral justification in some 
ways as powerful as that evoked by [Afro-Christianity] a generation later."39 
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      International events deepened and broadened that consciousness. African 
Americans and their allies were among the first to grasp the enormity of the Nazi 
persecution of the Jews and to drive home the parallels between racism and anti-
Semitism. In so doing, they used revulsion against the Holocaust to undermine racism 
at home and to "turn world opinion against Jim Crow." A "rising wind" of popular 
anticolonialism, inspired by the national liberation struggles in Africa and Asia that 
erupted after the war, also legitimized black aspirations and linked the denial of civil 
rights at home to the exploitation of the colonized peoples around the globe as well as 
to racially exclusive immigration and naturalization laws.40 
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      At the same time, Popular Front culture encouraged labor feminism, a multiclass, 
union-oriented strand within the women's movement in which black women played a 
central role. Women joined the labor movement in record numbers in the 1940s, and 
by the end of the decade they had moved into leadership positions. The labor 
feminists among them fought for access to jobs, fair treatment, and expanded social 
supports within their unions and on the shop floor. They aimed to "de-gender" the 
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idea of the family wage by asserting that women too were breadwinners. They also 
wanted to transform "the masculine pattern" of work, first by eliminating all invidious 
distinctions between male and female workers and then by demanding innovations, 
such as federally funded child care, that addressed the burdens of women's double 
day. Paralleling and reinforcing labor feminism, women in the Communist movement 
launched a women's liberation campaign. Articulated by Claudia Jones, the leading 
black woman leader in the Communist party, and pushed forward by the Congress of 
American Women, the concept of the triple oppression of black women—by virtue of 
their race, class, and gender—stood at the center of a tradition of left or progressive 
feminism that saw women's issues as inseparable from those of race and class.41 
      Spurred by this broad insurgency, as well as by the turn of black leaders from 
"parallelism" (the creation of black institutions and the demand for separate but equal 
public services) to a push for full inclusion, black political activism soared and 
barriers to economic and political democracy tumbled. The Wagner Act and the 
National War Labor Board helped workers temper the power of corporations and 
forward the dream of workplace democracy that had animated American reform 
consciousness since the Progressive Era. In response to pressure from below, led 
mainly by A. Philip Randolph and the Brotherhood of Sleeping Car Porters, President 
Franklin D. Roosevelt established a Fair Employment Practices Committee (FEPC) in 
1941, putting racial discrimination on the national agenda for the first time since 
Reconstruction. In 1944 the Supreme Court brought a half century of acquiescence in 
political exclusion to an end when it declared the white primary unconstitutional. 
Rivaling in importance the later and more celebrated Brown decision, Smith v. 
Allwright sparked a major, South-wide voter registration drive. Other victories 
included the desegregation of the military, the outlawing of racial restrictive 
covenants and segregation in interstate commerce and graduate education, and the 
equalization of the salaries of black and white teachers in some southern states.42 
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The Chill of the Cold War   
Those breakthroughs contributed to the movement's momentum, but they also met 
fierce resistance, as the long backlash accelerated. In the late 1940s, northern business 
interests joined conservative southern Democrats in a drive to roll back labor's 
wartime gains, protect the South's cheap labor supply, and halt the expansion of the 
New Deal. Their weapon of choice was a mass-based but elite-manipulated 
anticommunist crusade that would profoundly alter the cultural and political terrain. 
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      The chief target was New Deal labor law. Like antidiscrimination and affirmative 
action programs in the 1960s and 1970s, the FEPC had enraged the conservative 
alliance, which defended the employer's right to hire and fire at will and equated fair 
hiring practices with quotas. After the war, probusiness conservatives quashed the 
campaign for a permanent FEPC, the chief item on the black-labor-left legislative 
agenda, in part by framing their opposition in the powerful new language of the Cold 
War. Sen. Strom Thurmond of South Carolina, for instance, painted the FEPC as a 
violation of the "American" principle of "local self-government" by a "federal police 
state" reminiscent of the Soviet Union. By demonizing the Communists in the labor 
movement, conservatives also pushed the Taft-Hartley Act through Congress. Under 

36  



Taft-Hartley's restrictions, the CIO expelled its left-wing unions, tempered its fight for 
social welfare programs that would benefit the whole working class, and settled for an 
increasingly bureaucratized system of collective bargaining that secured higher wages 
and private welfare protections for its own members, mainly white male workers in 
heavy industries. Despite this so-called labor-management accord, American 
corporations remained fundamentally hostile toward both unions and the regulatory 
state, leaving even the workers who profited from the constricted collective 
bargaining system vulnerable to a renewed corporate offensive in the 1970s and 
1980s, an offensive that, in combination with economic stagnation, 
deindustrialization, and automation, would cripple the trade-union movement for 
years to come.43 
      To be sure, even as domestic anticommunism helped drive labor to the right and 
weaken civil rights unionism's institutional base, it gave civil rights advocates a potent 
weapon: the argument that the United States' treatment of its black citizens 
undermined its credibility abroad. At a time when the State Department was laboring 
to draw a stark contrast between American democracy and Soviet terror, win the 
allegiance of the newly independent nations of Asia and Africa, and claim leadership 
of the "free world," competition with the Soviet Union gave government officials a 
compelling reason to ameliorate black discontent and, above all, to manage the image 
of American race relations abroad. As a result, civil rights leaders who were willing to 
mute their criticism of American foreign policy and distance themselves from the Left 
gained a degree of access to the halls of power they had never had before. On balance, 
historians have emphasized the effectiveness of this strategy and viewed the 
movement's successes in the 1950s as "at least in part a product of the Cold War."44 
Seen through the optic of the long civil rights movement, however, civil rights look 
less like a product of the Cold War and more like a casualty. 
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      That is so because antifascism and anticolonialism had already internationalized 
the race issue and, by linking the fate of African Americans to that of oppressed 
people everywhere, had given their cause a transcendent meaning. Anticommunism, 
on the other hand, stifled the social democratic impulses that antifascism and 
anticolonialism encouraged, replacing them with a Cold War racial liberalism that, at 
best, failed to deliver on its promise of reform (with the partial exception of the 
judiciary, the federal government took no effective action throughout the 1950s) and, 
at worst, colluded with the right-wing red scare to narrow the ideological ground on 
which civil rights activists could stand. To take just one example: Both left-wing and 
centrist black leaders seized the opportunity offered by the 1945 founding of the 
United Nations (UN) to define the plight of African Americans as a "human rights" 
issue, a concept that in UN treaties denoted not just freedom from political and legal 
discrimination but also the right to education, health care, housing, and employment. 
Although eager to convince emerging African nations of America's racial progress, 
the State Department blocked that endeavor, insulating the internal affairs of the 
United States from the oversight of the UN while carefully separating protected civil 
liberties from economic justice and branding the whole campaign for a robust human 
rights program a Soviet plot. Thwarted in its efforts, the National Association for the 
Advancement of Colored People (NAACP) abandoned both economic issues and the 
battle against segregation in the North and devoted its considerable resources to clear-
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cut cases of de jure segregation in the South, thus severing its ties to the black Popular 
Front and increasingly weakening the link between race and class.45 
      The presidential campaign of 1948 marked both the high point and the demise of 
the postwar black-labor-left coalition. The coalition found a national voice in Henry 
Wallace, a New Dealer who broke with the Democratic party and ran for president on 
a third-party ticket. Courting the black vote with a progressive civil rights platform, 
Democratic party candidate Harry S. Truman trounced Wallace but alienated the 
Dixiecrats, conservative southern congressmen who bolted the Democratic convention 
and formed their own party—a way station, as it turned out, on a road that would lead 
many conservative white southerners to support George C. Wallace briefly and then, 
with the election of Richard M. Nixon in 1972, move in large numbers to the 
Republican party.46 
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      The Dixiecrats also left another legacy. They perfected a combination of race- and 
red-baiting that defeated the South's leading New Deal politicians in the critical 
election of 1950 and, ten years later, allowed segregationists to claim that the civil 
rights movement was "communist inspired." Red-baiting thus got a second lease on 
life, spawning a dense network of "little HUACs" and "little FBIs," local imitations of 
the House Committee on Un-American Activities and the Federal Bureau of 
Investigation, throughout the South. Led by some of the region's most powerful 
politicians, notably Mississippi's James Eastland, those agencies hounded 
"subversives" of every sort, from veterans of the black-labor-left alliance, to local 
NAACP officials, to gay teachers, to national civil rights leaders, thus extending 
McCarthyism well into the 1960s, long after it had fallen into disrepute at the national 
level.47 
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The Classical Phase of the Movement   
In the South, perhaps more than anywhere else in the country, the Cold War destroyed 
Popular Front institutions and diverted the civil rights movement into new channels. 
When the so-called classical phase of the movement erupted in the late 1950s and 
1960s, it involved blacks and whites, southerners and northerners, local people and 
federal officials, secularists and men and women of faith. It also extended far beyond 
the South, and throughout the country it drew on multiple, competing ideological 
strands. But on the ground, in the South, the movement's ability to rally participants, 
stymie its enemies, and break through the fog of the Cold War came largely from the 
prophetic tradition within the black church. Cold War liberals counseled patience 
while countering international criticism by suggesting that racism was not woven into 
American institutions; it was limited to the South, a retrograde region that economic 
development would eventually bring into line with an otherwise democratic nation. 
By contrast, southern civil rights activists, mobilizing the latent themes of justice and 
deliverance in an otherworldly religion, demanded "freedom now," not gradual, top-
down amelioration. That prophetic vision gave believers the courage to engage history 
as an ongoing process of reconstruction, to risk everything for ideals they might never 
see fulfilled.48 
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      Those ideals have often been misconstrued, not only by those on the right who 
reduce them to color blindness but also by those on the left who stress the southern 
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movement's limitations. In their zeal to make up for inattention to the freedom 
struggle in the North and West, for instance, urban historians sometimes draw a 
misleading contrast between a northern embrace of economics and black power and a 
southern commitment to a minimalist program of interracialism and integration. That 
dichotomy ignores both the long history of nonviolent struggles against segregation in 
the North and the fact that black southerners were schooled in a quest both for access 
and for self-determination that dated back to emancipation, a quest that called forth 
strategies ranging from tactical alliances across the color line, to the building of 
separate institutions, to migration, to economic boycotts and direct action.49 In both 
regions, the success of the movement depended not just on idealism and courage, but 
on a keen understanding and ready use of the fulcrums of power. 
      There was, moreover, nothing minimalist about dismantling Jim Crow, a system 
built as much on economic exploitation as on de jure and de facto spatial separation. 
In the minds of movement activists, integration was never about "racial mingling" or 
"merely sitting next to whites in school," as it is sometimes caricatured now.50 Nor did 
it imply assimilation into static white-defined institutions, however much whites 
assumed that it did. True integration was and is an expansive and radical goal, not an 
ending or abolition of something that once was—the legal separation of bodies by 
race—but a process of transforming institutions and building an equitable, 
democratic, multiracial, and multiethnic society.51 

43  

 

 

  

 

These women protesters at the August 1963 March on 
Washington forthrightly issued demands that had a long history in 
the long civil rights movement: decent housing, equal rights, 
voting rights, and jobs for all. Photograph by Wally McNamee. 
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      The 1963 March on Washington, which came at the height of what figures in the 
dominant narrative as the good, color-blind movement, is a case in point. Today's 
conservatives make much of Martin Luther King's dream that "children will one day 
live in a nation where they will not be judged by the color of their skin but by the 
content of their character." But virtually nothing in the dominant narrative would lead 
us to expect an image of the march that showed women carrying signs demanding 
jobs for all, decent housing, fair pay, and equal rights "NOW!," thus asserting both 
their racial solidarity and their identities as activists and workers and thereby the 
equals of men.52 Nothing in the dominant story reminds us that this demonstration, 
which mobilized people from all walks of life and from every part of the country, was 
a "march for jobs and freedom"—and that from early on women were in the front 
ranks, helping to link race, class, and gender and thus foreshadowing both black 
feminism and the expansive movement of movements the civil rights struggle set in 
motion.53 

44  

      In recent years we have learned more and more about the continuities between the 
1940s and the 1960s, especially about the civil rights activists who came to political 
consciousness in the earlier period and then groomed and guided the young men and 
women who stepped forward in later years. E. D. Nixon, the stalwart NAACP leader 
who recruited King for the Montgomery bus boycott, was a veteran of the 
Brotherhood of Sleeping Car Porters, the black-led union that was central to the 
movement in the 1940s. Ella Baker passed on to the Student Nonviolent Coordinating 
Committee (SNCC) the radical pedagogy and organizing style she had learned both 
from her upbringing in the rural South and from the left-wing politics of Harlem in the 
1930s and 1940s. Bayard Rustin, one of the movement's most brilliant strategists, had 
been "an eager young explorer of the American left, broadly defined." Anne Braden, a 
white southerner who became, as Angela Y. Davis put it, a "legend" to young 
radicals, worked for Left-led unions in the late 1940s and continues to carry the 
banner of antiracism to this day. Frances Pauley got her start working for the New 
Deal in Georgia, helped mobilize white women on behalf of desegregation, and spent 
the rest of her life in the fight for civil rights and against poverty.54 
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      The differences and discontinuities, however, were critical as well. The activists 
of the 1960s relied on independent protest organizations; they could not ground their 
battle in growing, vibrant, social democratic unions. They also suffered from a rupture 
in the narrative, a void at the center of the story of the modern civil rights struggle that 
is only now beginning to be filled. Many young activists of the 1960s saw their efforts 
as a new departure and themselves as a unique generation, not as actors with much to 
learn from an earlier, labor-infused civil rights tradition. Persecution, censorship, and 
self-censorship reinforced that generational divide by sidelining independent black 
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radicals, thus whitening the memory and historiography of the Left and leaving later 
generations with an understanding of black politics that dichotomizes nationalism and 
integrationism. The civil rights unionism of the 1940s— which combined a principled 
and tactical belief in interracial organizing with a strong emphasis on black culture 
and institutions—was lost to memory. As the movement waned and contrary political 
forces resumed power, that loss left a vacuum for the current dominant narrative to 
fill.55 
    
Beyond Declension   
In the dominant narrative, the decline of the movement follows hard on the heels of 
the Civil Rights and Voting Rights acts, and the popular struggles of the 1970s 
become nothing more than identity politics, divisive squabbles that promoted 
tribalism, alienated white workers, and swelled the ranks of the New Right.56 The 
view of the 1970s as a tragic denouement belittles second-wave feminism and other 
movements that emerged from the black freedom struggle and institutionalized 
themselves even as they served as the New Right's antagonists and foils. It also erases 
from popular memory the way the victories of the early 1960s coalesced into a lasting 
social revolution, as thousands of ordinary people pushed through the doors the 
movement had opened and worked to create new, integrated institutions where none 
had existed before.57 
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      The literature on the post-sixties is still in its infancy, and except in accounts of 
the women's and gay rights movements, scholars left, right, and center have told 
stories of declension. A burst of new work on the black power movement, however, 
has departed from that model, documenting "an African American ... political 
renaissance" in the 1970s, in which advocates of black political power put forth a 
program of urban reform that echoed the demands raised thirty years before.58 Studies 
of other aspects of the black freedom movement in the North also offer powerful 
evidence that the civil rights movement did not die when it "went north" in the late 
1960s, in part because it had been north all along. Still needed is more research on all 
aspects of the movement of movements in the post-sixties that rivals in nuance and 
complexity what we know about the classical phase.59 
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      The studies that we do have reveal overlapping grass-roots struggles. One struggle 
involved the move from token to comprehensive school desegregation in the South, 
which took place not during the turbulent short civil rights movement, but in the 
1970s, after the media spotlight had swung away from the region. Another involved 
the desegregation of the workplace and the widespread acceptance of fair employment 
practices as a worthy goal. Like civil rights unionism, both of those advances have 
been forgotten or distorted. Both deserve to move from the margins to the center of 
the civil rights saga. Both, moreover, belong not to the past, but to the present, not to a 
story of right-wing triumph and over-and-done-with declension, but to an ongoing 
project whose key crises may still lie ahead. 
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      The Brown decision and the rock-throwing mobs of Little Rock occupy pride of 
place in the popular narrative of school desegregation in the South. Barely noted is 
another critical turning point, a case in which black and white southerners grappled 
directly with the spatialization of race in the region. In Swann v. Charlotte-Mecklen-
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burg Board of Education (1971), a case originating in North Carolina, civil rights 
lawyers exposed the artificial distinction between de jure and de facto segregation by 
demonstrating beyond a doubt that governmental policies, not benign-sounding 
customs, had created an almost totally segregated school system. "'I lived here for 
twenty-four years without knowing what was going on,'" commented Judge James 
McMillan, who handed down a historic decision ordering two-way busing of black 
children to wealthy white suburbs and suburban children to city schools. A vigorous 
white homeowners' movement fought the decision tooth and nail, couching its 
opposition, not in the discredited rhetoric of massive resistance that surrounded the 
Little Rock debacle, but in a language of color blindness that resonated nationwide.60 
      More surprising, given how busing has come to symbolize all that went wrong 
with the dream of integration, a coalition of blue-collar activists, women's groups, 
white liberals, and black parents arose to defeat the homeowners' movement. 
Moreover, Charlotte took the unusual step of maintaining one of its historically black 
high schools rather than tearing it down and putting the burden on black students to 
sink or swim in hostile, white-dominated institutions. That school—West Charlotte 
High School—launched an experiment in true integration that reverberates to this day. 
Although many of the city's white students decamped to private schools, as they did 
throughout the South, Charlotte's success became such a point of civic pride that when 
the presidential candidate Ronald Reagan announced, during a campaign stop in 1984, 
that court-ordered busing "takes innocent children out of the neighborhood schools 
and makes them pawns in a social experiment that nobody wants," his largely 
Republican audience responded with an "awkward silence" that spoke louder than 
words.61 Twenty years later, interviews conducted separately by the Southern Oral 
History Program and by researchers at Columbia University's Teachers College 
suggested that, especially for students at West Charlotte High during the peak years of 
integration, confronting racial differences and crossing racial boundaries was life 
changing in ways that test scores and statistics cannot capture. They treasured the 
experience, felt that it had dissipated "the hostility and the hate" of early years, and 
struggled to maintain a degree of diversity in their later lives.62 
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      By the 1980s aggressive court supervision plus ongoing pressure from black 
parents and students and their white allies had done what no one could have predicted: 
they had endowed the South with the most integrated school systems in the country, 
an achievement that has virtually disappeared from the master narrative and barely 
registers even in scholarly accounts of the movement. The era of desegregation was 
marked by other forms of political and economic progress as well, most notably the 
surge in black voter registration and the election of black officials after the Voting 
Rights Act of 1965 and the desegregation of the work force, as grass-roots activists 
took advantage of Title VII of the Civil Rights Act, which barred employment 
discrimination by race and sex. Each of those advances reinforced the other. Black 
voters acquired a leverage with school boards and access to public employment they 
had never enjoyed before. As black students escaped from schools of concentrated 
poverty and took advantage of preschool and after-school programs, smaller classes, 
superior facilities, and other benefits long monopolized by suburban schools, a 
growing percentage attended college and entered managerial and professional 
positions. In a society in which economic status was increasingly determined by 
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education, the black middle class expanded.63 Nothing, perhaps, reflects the success of 
this push for political representation, jobs, and education more vividly than the 
phenomenon of return migration to the South. In the 1970s African Americans, who 
for more than half a century had fled or been pushed from the region, began 
answering a "call to home." Drawn by new opportunities, they returned in droves, not 
just to the cities, but to the small towns and rural areas of the region.64 
      As blacks sought to reclaim the South and the South rejoined the country, 
however, the country was moving, seemingly inexorably, toward resegregation. In 
1973 and 1974 the Supreme Court made two fateful decisions, each of which 
"insulated predominately white suburban school districts from the constitutional 
imperatives of Brown ... and offered white parents in urban districts fearful of school 
desegregation havens of predominately white public schools to which they could 
flee." Ignoring the public policies that had created the white enclaves in the first place, 
the Supreme Court in Milliken v. Bradley (1974) exempted the suburbs around Detroit 
from desegregation plans on the grounds that they had not engaged in recent, 
intentional acts of discrimination. In San Antonio Independent School District v. 
Rodriguez (1973), the Court ruled that the states faced no obligation under the federal 
Constitution to equalize funding among school districts. By the early 1990s, the 
Reagan-Bush courts were lifting the court-ordered desegregation plans of the 1970s, 
even in states where dual school systems had been required by law. After only two 
decades, the courts effectively abandoned the effort to enforce desegregation. By the 
late 1990s, judges had gone so far as to prohibit school boards from voluntarily using 
considerations of race (and thus of history and social reality) to maintain their hard-
won progress toward integration.65 
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      Throughout the South and the country, except in the Northeast, which never 
experienced significant desegregation, resegregation is now proceeding apace. Often 
blamed on the reflexive racism connoted by the all-purpose term "white flight" or, 
more recently, on black disillusionment with integration, that reversal can be better 
understood as the outcome, in an atmosphere of judicial hostility, of long-term 
failures to limit residential segregation, halt the decay of inner cities, prevent urban 
sprawl, address growing class divisions, and alter school-funding arrangements that 
favor suburban schools. Under such circumstances, it is no wonder that middle-class 
parents of both races feel acute pressure to buy homes in neighborhoods with 
reputable, well-financed schools and that parents in now hypersegregated inner cities 
sometimes demand the resources they hope will provide their children with a separate 
but equal education. Those pressures, moreover, have intensified as the No Child Left 
Behind Act, passed in 2002, has shifted the focus of educational policy away from 
funding and onto accountability and assessment in ways that often punish resource-
poor schools, drive away the best teachers and better-off students, and deepen poverty 
and segregation. And yet, in spite of everything, large majorities of both whites and 
blacks maintain a commitment to integration—a commitment that public policy 
makers and pundits have done nothing to promote and are doing their best to 
squander.66 
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      If the continuing story of school desegregation has been obscured by a narrative of 
post-1965 declension, the struggle for economic justice has been erased altogether. 
That struggle took many forms. In Seattle, Washington, the Congress of Racial 
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Equality (CORE) launched its first direct-action campaign against employment 
discrimination in 1961 and followed up in 1964 with one of the most ambitious 
campaigns in the nation. In Memphis, Tennessee, black workers persisted in seeing 
civil rights and workers' rights as two aspects of the same struggle; the 1968 sanitation 
strike—best known as the context of King's assassination—was part of a decades-long 
push by black workers to attain better workplace conditions and fair wages. In 
Oakland, California, and other places, the Black Panthers called for a redistribution of 
economic and political power in cities devastated by four decades of failed 
metropolitan policies.67 
      More likely to be included in the prevailing narrative is President Lyndon B. 
Johnson's War on Poverty, an ambitious effort not only to join the issues of 
economics and civil rights, but also to expand the New Deal in order to address the 
economic inequalities embedded in American institutions. Launched in 1965, the 
program fell far short of its goals, not, as conservatives would have it, because it 
"threw money" at problems that only private enterprise and individual effort could 
solve, but because it did not go nearly far enough and because the minimally funded 
initiatives it did launch focused so heavily on "supply side" solutions such as job 
training, rather than on full employment, unionization, and the redistribution of 
economic resources. Nevertheless, the Great Society yielded lasting and important 
results (Medicaid and Head Start come immediately to mind), and it turned many 
activists in the direction of structural economic solutions.68 
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      By contrast, the grass-roots movement set in motion by Title VII of the Civil 
Rights Act of 1964 has been among the least noted of the movement's economic 
dimensions. Thousands of men and women, including a persistent and evolving 
network of labor feminists, pursued their rights under that historic law by signing 
petitions, filing class-action lawsuits, seeking affirmative action policies that specified 
hiring goals and timetables, and stepping forward to become courageous pioneers, the 
first of their race or sex to brave the minefields of long-segregated occupations. Once 
on the job, black workers became the most avid of new union members, and the 
understanding of workplace rights they brought with them inspired a surge of 
organizing in the public sector, which became one of the brightest spots in an 
otherwise-bleak landscape for organized labor. In combination, government 
intervention and grass-roots action made 1965–1975 the breakthrough period for 
black economic progress, especially in the South. That victory inspired Latinos and 
other to make similar demands and adopt similar strategies. As a result, legal 
protection of individuals from workplace discrimination was extended to a large 
majority of Americans, including not only people of color and all women, but also the 
elderly and the disabled.69 
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      In the early 1970s, moreover, a remarkable union democracy movement sought to 
revitalize the labor movement, and a wave of strikes swept the country, suggesting 
that the white workers now seen as preordained "Reagan Democrats" were by no 
means united, and that their allegiance was "up for grabs."70 At the same time, a little-
noticed cohort of civil rights veterans threw in their lot with the labor movement and 
launched labor support campaigns. As rank-and-file workers, rising labor leaders, 
labor lawyers, and the like, they joined other civil rights activists in an effort to "raise 
issues of economic equality ... to the moral high ground earlier occupied by the assault 
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against de jure segregation."71 
      Like the battle to desegregate the public schools, the struggle for economic justice 
met formidable barriers. Some were deep-seated, such as American individualism, the 
intensification of capital flight, and the legacy of anticommunism, which, in 
combination with the New Right's "war of ideas," tainted all attempts at redistribution. 
Others were produced by the unique economic crisis of the 1970s. Brought on by the 
simultaneous rise of unemployment and inflation known as "stagflation," the crisis 
galvanized a corporate offensive against unions and accelerated an ongoing process of 
economic restructuring that forwarded the emergence of a service economy and 
destroyed not only the strongholds of organized labor in the rust belt, but the South's 
traditional industries as well. At the same time, economic change in Latin America 
and the alteration of immigration restrictions in the 1960s sent millions of Latinos 
searching for work in northern cities. This wave of Third World immigration created 
new hybrid identities and spawned new liberation movements. But as the labor supply 
swelled and the blue-collar jobs opened up by Title VII evaporated, communities of 
color suffered from shocking rates of unemployment, and inner cities turned into 
burnt-out wastelands from which few could hope to escape.72 
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      As layoffs skyrocketed, moreover, increasing numbers of white male workers, 
influenced by conservatives' pseudopopulist claims, blamed affirmative action, 
despite conclusive evidence that employers' efforts to hire and promote blacks and 
women did not lead to significant "reverse discrimination." As Thomas Sugrue has 
noted, "Long-term economic restructuring was inscrutable to most white workers. But 
affirmative action was an easy target"—in part because powerful stories and 
storytellers made it so.73 The struggle for the equal rights amendment and abortion 
rights had a similar impact on some working-class wives. Dependent on men in an 
atmosphere of deepening economic insecurity and inundated with New Right attacks 
on the women's movement as an antifamily, elitist plot, they opposed reform in part 
out of fear that feminism would "free men first," leaving women with no claim to 
male protection and support.74 
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      These developments helped to propel the New Right to power and encouraged the 
Reagan administration's efforts to gut antidiscrimination enforcement mechanisms. 
This deregulation of the labor market forwarded a resurgence of antiblack 
discrimination based on "hidden preferences and stereotypes" that are well 
documented but almost impossible to prove and thus helped reverse almost two 
decades of black economic gains.75 Still, as Nancy MacLean argues, the right wing's 
triumph was by no means complete, in part because Reagan's efforts aroused a storm 
of opposition from advocacy groups, and in part because many large corporations, 
after years of resistance, embraced affirmative action, albeit in the new, watered-down 
form of "diversity"—a move designed, not to forward redistributive justice, but to 
help businesses reach new consumers and operate in global markets. The result is a 
stalemate that underscores both the ground won by advocates of economic access and 
the need for broader federal action to promote full employment, tame corporate 
power, and protect unions. On the one hand, government policy, driven by grass-roots 
pressure, succeeded in cracking the edifice of racial discrimination erected over time 
by both employers and white-dominated unions. On the other, economic restructuring 
drove home how far beyond the reach of governmental protections against 
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discrimination workers' dilemmas often lay. Without a strong collective voice, 
workers had no means of defending themselves against unfair labor practices (as 
opposed to willful bias against individuals) or of countering corporate control of the 
state. Nor could they build on and expand the legacy of civil rights unionism by 
transforming the fight for fair employment into an antiracist, antisexist, social 
democratic project for the twenty-first century.76 
    
Conclusion   
The challenges faced by the civil rights movement stemmed from what Martin Luther 
King Jr. called "evils that are rooted deeply in the whole structure of our society," 
evils that reflected not just the legacy of slavery but also the perpetuation of that 
legacy during subsequent generations by racialized state policies that wove white 
privilege into the fabric of American culture and institutions.77 Despite the 
movement's undeniable triumphs, those evils persist and in some ways have been 
compounded. The resegregation of the public schools; the hypersegregation of inner 
cities; the soaring unemployment rates among black and Latino youths; the erosion of 
minority voting rights; the weakening of the labor movement; the wealth and income 
gap that is returning the United States to pre–New Deal conditions; the unraveling of 
the social safety net; the ever-increasing ability of placeless capital to move at will; 
the malignant growth of the "prison-industrial complex," which far outstrips 
apartheid-era South Africa in incarcerating black men—those historical legacies 
cannot be waved away by declaring victory, mandating formal, race-neutral public 
policies, and allowing market forces to rule.78 
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      Nor, of course, will understanding how the past weighs on the present in itself 
resolve current dilemmas. But it can help cut through the miasma of evasion and 
confusion that cripples our creativity from the start. For many white Americans have 
moved through what the critical theorist Walter Benjamin termed "this storm ... we 
call progress" without coming to terms with the past.79 That lack of accounting opens 
the way to a color-blind conservatism that is breathtakingly ahistorical and blind to 
social facts. It impoverishes public discourse, discourages investment in public 
institutions, and undermines our will to address the inequalities and injustices that 
surround us now. 
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      The narratives spun by the new conservatives maintain a strong hold on the public 
imagination, in part because they have been repeated so often and broadcast so 
widely, and in part because they avoid uncomfortable questions about the relationship 
between cumulative white advantage and present social ills. Yet there is reason to 
hope that countervailing stories could make themselves heard and could even, under 
the right circumstances, prevail. Opinion poll after poll indicates that white racial 
attitudes have changed dramatically since World War II, that support for the 
principles of integration and equal treatment remains high (even as approval of 
governmental intervention to accomplish those goals has declined), and that most 
white as well as black Americans continue to favor the keystones of the New Deal 
order.80 Those attitudes should not be underestimated. They do not mean that hidden 
or even overt biases have disappeared or that sedimented, institutional inequalities 
have been eliminated. But they are the ground in which new understandings of today's 
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problems can take root. Those understandings must grapple both with history, which 
explodes the notion that racial disparities are caused by black failings, and with the 
abundant evidence that the distress of people of color today is indeed "the first sign of 
a danger that threatens us all." That danger—whose signs range from the every-
family-for-itself scramble for "good schools" to the high cost of "prisons, police, 
mopping-up health care services, and other reactive measures"—if amplified by 
public storytellers, could combine with antiracist principles to create a climate in 
which fresh solutions to social problems can emerge.81 
      Historians can and must play a central role in a struggle that turns so centrally on 
understanding the legacy of the past. But how can we make ourselves heard without 
reducing history to the formulaic mantras on which political narratives usually rely? 
To tell our stories both truly and effectively, we need modes of writing and speaking 
that emphasize individual agency, the sine qua non of narrative, while also 
dramatizing the hidden history of policies and institutions—the publicly sanctioned 
choices that continually shape and reshape the social landscape and yet are often 
invisible to citizens trained in not seeing and in thinking exclusively in ahistorical, 
personal terms. We cannot settle for simple dichotomies (especially those that pit race 
against class, race-targeted against universalistic remedies, and so-called identity 
politics against economic policy and unionization), no matter how seductive they 
might be. Finally, we must forego easy closure and satisfying upward or downward 
arcs. 
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      Only such novel forms of storytelling can convey what it means to have lived 
through an undefeated but unfinished revolution, a world-defining social movement 
that has experienced both reversals and victories and whose victories are now, once 
again, being partially reversed.82 Both the victories and the reversals call us to action, 
as citizens and as historians with powerful stories to tell. Both are part of a long and 
ongoing civil rights movement. Both can help us imagine—for our own times—a new 
way of life, a continuing revolution. 
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